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a. 2016 Parcel E - Lots: 1, 2, 3, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21 with road and utility
construction coinciding with the lot development.

b. 2017 Parcel A - Lots: 6 though 12 with road and utility construction
coinciding with the lot development.

c. 2017 Parcel E - Lots: 4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 13, 14, 15, and 16, with road and
utility construction coincidingwith the lot development.

d. 2018 Parcel E - Lots: 9, 10, 11, and 12 with road and utility
construction coinciding with the lot development.

e. 2018 Parcel A - Lots: 1 though 5 and 33, 34, 35 with road and utility
construction coinciding with the lot development.

f. 2019 Parcel A - Lots: 13 though 18 and 25, 26, 32 with road and
utility construction coincidingwith the lot development.

g. 2019 Parcel D - Lots: 1 though 7 with road and utility construction
coinciding with the lot development.

h. 2020 Parcel A - Lots: 19 though 24 with road and utility construction
coincidingwith the lot development.

i. 2020 Parcel G - Lots: 1 though 4 with road and utility construction
coinciding with the lot development.

j. 2021 Parcel A - Lots: 48 though 52 with road and utility construction
coinciding with the lot development.

k. 2022 Parcel A - Lots: 35 though 37 and 31 with road and utility
construction coinciding with the lot development.

1. 2022 Parcel H - Lots: 1 though 7 with road and utility construction
coinciding with the lot development.

m. 2023 Parcel A - Lots: 38 though 41 and 28 though 30 with road and
utility construction coinciding with the lot development.

n. 2024 Parcel A - Lots: 42 though 47 and lot 27 with road and utility
construction coinciding with the lot development.

o. 2017 Parcel B - Lots 65 through 69 with road and utility construction
coinciding with the lot development.

p. 2018 Parcel B - Lots 60 through 64 with road and utility construction
coinciding with the lot development.

q. 2019 Parcel B - Lots 55 through 59 with road and utility
construction coinciding with the lot development.

r. 2020 Parcel B - Lots 49 through 54 with road and utility
construction coinciding with the lot development.

s. 2021 Parcel B - Lots with road and utility construction coinciding
with the lot development.

t. 2022 Parcel B - Lots 43 through 48 with road and utility
construction coinciding with the lot development.

u. 2023 Parcel B - Lots 37 through 42 with road and utility construction
coinciding with the lot development.



v. 2024 Parcel B - Lots 7-10 and 19-22 with road and utility
construction coinciding with the lot development.

w. 2025 Parcel B - Lots 1-6 and 11-18 with road and utility construction
coinciding with the lot development.

x. 2026 Parcel B - Lots 23- 27 with road and utility construction
coinciding with the lot development.

y. 2027 Parcel B - Lots 28-32 with road and utility construction
coinciding with the lot development.

z. 2028 Parcel B - Lots 33-36 with road and utility construction
coinciding with the lot development.

aa. 2021 Parcel C - Lot 1 with 4 units with road and utility construction
coinciding with the lot development.

bb. 2022 Parcel C - Lot 2 with 4 units with road and utility construction
coinciding with the lot development.

cc. 2023 Parcel C - Lot 3 with 4 units with road and utility construction
coinciding with the lot development.

dd. 2024 Parcel C - Lot 4 with 4 units with road and utility construction
coinciding with the lot development.

ee. 2025 Parcel C - Lot 5 with 4 units with road and utility construction
coinciding with the lot development.

ff. 2026 Parcel C - Lot 6 with 4 units with road and utility construction
coinciding with the lot development.

gg. 2027 Parcel C - Lot 7 with 4 units with road and utility construction
coinciding with the lot development.

hh. 2028 Parcel C - Lot 8 with 4 units with road and utility construction
coinciding with the lot development.

ii. 2029 Parcel C - Lot 9 with 4 units with road and utility construction
coinciding with the lot development.

jj. 2030 Parcel C - Lot 10 with 4 units with road and utility construction
coinciding with the lot development.

kk. 2031 Parcel C - Lot 11 with 4 units with road and utility construction
coinciding with the lot development.

11. 2032 Parcel C - Lot 12 with 4 units with road and utility construction
coinciding with the lot development.
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